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EDITOR’S CORNER 

With the first issue of Volume 22, Mosquito 
Systematics has undergone a face lift which we 
hope will prove more attractive to subscribers 
and authors. The double column format will 
insure a uniformity in appearance for all papers, 
and will overcome the objections of those who 
objected to the lack of same in past issues. This 
change will make Mosquito Systematics similar 
to the format used in AMCA’s Journal. The 
blue cover will be retained and the larger size 
will remain. However, unlike the Journal, au- 
thors are not required to be members of AMCA 
in order to submit papers. 

Some significant changes have been made in 
procedures involved in submitting and process- 

ing papers. Potential authors are urged to read 
the “Instructions to Contributors” (located on 
inside back cover) carefully before submitting 
papers. 

Due to increased expenses involved in 
publishing Mosquito Systematics it has become 
necessary to increase page charges to $35 per 
page. This charge will also include plates and 
illustrations. Reprint charges have been in- 
creased over present rates. 

These new charges, which are listed on the 
inside back cover, will go into effect immedi- 
ately. However, papers which are in press or 
have already been received by the Editor will be 
charged at the old rates. 




